
 
 

YOUNGSTOWN STATE UNIVERSITY 
Bid Tabulation Sheet 

YSU Campus Roof Replacement - YSU 2324-02 

Plans By: Prime AE 
Bids Opened and Read By: Alan Miller 
Bids Tabulated By: Bill Spencer 

Project #: 2324-02 
Bid Opening: 5/3/2023 
Time: 2:00 PM

Vendor List Bond POA Addenda 
Noted (2) 

  Base Bid Total Alternate 1 
Cushwa Mod-

Bit 

Alternate 2 
Salata Mod-Bit 

Alternate 3 
Cushwa Area H 

Alternate 4 
Cushwa Area I 

Alternate 5 
Cushwa Area J 

Alternate 6 
Cushwa 

Plywood Deck 

$2,000,000.00 $94,600.00 $50,200.00 $106,000.00 $99,000.00 $99,000.00 $23,700.00 

Heartland Construction X X X $2,025,000.00 No Bid No Bid $93,600.00 $83,200.00 $83,200.00 $24,000.00 

RJK Roofing Solutions X X X $1,973,865.00 No Bid No Bid $101,850.00 $94,650.00 $94,650.00 $15,500.00 

Boak & Sons X X X $2,091,858.00 No Bid No Bid $87,807.00 $87,807.00 $87,807.00 $153,819.00 

Ramp Construction X X X $2,480,630.00 $500,000.00 $200,000.00 $96,000.00 $92,000.00 $89,000.00 $130,000.00 




